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PUBLIC WORKS 
 

PW-001 STREETWISE: SETTING UP TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES.  VHS/23 
min.  An excellent film from the City of Lincoln explaining the proper 
techniques used for safe and successful traffic control through the use of 
cones, barricades, flagmen and lighted vehicles. Discusses how 
preplanning is an important part of safety and how the various types of 
traffic control devices should be used and where to use them. (1987) 

 
PW-002 HEAVY EQUIPMENT SAFETY.  VHS/30 min.  This video discusses many 

of the concerns of heavy equipment operators such as: job site 
inspections; pre-startup inspections; safe operating practices and 
shutdown procedures. Adapted from AWWA - Safe Operation of Heavy 
Equipment, shows no live footage. Film is a good review for equipment 
operators. (1987)  

 
PW-003 WHITE GOLD.  VHS/25 min.  An excellent film on the aspects of snow 

and ice removal. Shows the type of equipment used for various 
conditions. New England Chapter, American Public Works Association. 
(1983)  

 
PW-004 PLOW POWER.  VHS/14 min.  Shows techniques for safe snow plowing 

of main streets, residential areas and lists uncontrollable factors involved 
in a snow storm which can create public emergencies. New England 
Chapter, American Public Works Association. (1987)  

 
PW-005 MOSQUITO CONTROL.  VHS/28 min.  Excellent tape for municipalities 

who practice mosquito control. Tape discusses the different types of 
mosquitoes, how to fight mosquito populations mechanically, chemically 
or biologically. Also discusses control timing and disease prevention. 
American Mosquito Control Association. 

 
PW-006 BACKHOE SAFETY & OPERATION.  VHS/8 min.  Inspection & 

maintenance checklists, capabilities and limitations, PPE, operation rules 
and digging positioning. (1995) 

 
PW-007 BREAKER/JACK HAMMER SAFETY.  VHS/5 min.  Brief overview of 

safe techniques while operating breaker/jack hammers. (1996) 
 
PW-008 SNOWPLOWING.  VHS/27 min.  Topics include proper dress and 

equipment, hook up, plow maintenance, various plowing techniques for 
lots and driveways as well as salting. Emphasis on how to plow safely and 
avoid property damage. Progress Products, (1996) 

 
PW-009 FLAGGING TRAFFIC SAFETY.  VHS/5 min.  Brief flagging  

responsibilities awareness, proper clothing and equipment along with 
tips on traffic control. Long Island Productions, (1996) 
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PUBLIC WORKS CONTINUED 

 
PW-010 WORK AREA PROTECTION.  VHS/18 min.  Covers the basics of work  

area protection and the importance of safety separating work areas from 
traffic areas. Components of a program, elements of traffic control, 
devices and concepts of traffic control zones. AWWA (1993) 

 
PW-011 TRENCHING & SHORING.  VHS/ min.  Defines both trenching and  

shoring. Covers the following; before the excavation begins, competent 
person, soil classification, protective supports, general safety tips and 
emergency response procedures. J.J. Keller Safety Series (1993)  
 

PW-012 DUMP TRUCK SAFETY.  VHS/14 min.  Tape discusses almost 
everything you would want to know about safe operation and care of 
dump trucks. Good tape for newly certified CDC personnel.  Long Island 
Productions. 

   
PW-013 HEAVY EQUIPMENT SAFETY.  DVD/ min.  Tape discusses almost 

everything you would want to know about safe operation and care of 
dump trucks. Good tape for newly certified CDC personnel.  Caterpillar. 

 
PW-014 SKID LOADER.  DVD/14 min.  A-Series skid loader safety and operating 

tip, Caterpillar multi-terrain loader O & M, along with safety basics on 
mounting and dismounting heavy equipment. Caterpillar. (2009) 

 
PW-015 SHAKE HANDS WITH DANGER. DVD/23 min.  Heavy equipment safety 

video. 
 
PW-016 ROLL OF DRUMS. DVD/20 min. Heavy equipment safety video. 
                    Copied in (2009). 
 
PW-017 MULTIPLE CHOICE. DVD/24 min.  Tape discusses  
 
 
PW-018 USING RUMBLE STRIPS TO AVOID ROAD CRASHES. DVD/00 min.  

Tape discusses Roadway Safety Foundation (Long Island Productions. 
 
 
PW-019 ROADWAY SAFETY +: AROAD CONSTRUCTIONINDUSTRY 

CONSORTIUM TRAING PROGRAM. DVD/00 min.  U.S. Department of 
Highway Transportation and the Federal Highway Administration. 

 
PW-020 TAKE PRIDE IN SEAT BELTS. DVD/00 min.  CDC Workplace Safety and 

Health. November 2008 
 
PW-021 TAKE PRIDE IN YOUR JOB: FALL PROTECTION. DVD/00 min.  CDC 

Workplace Safety and Health. November 2008 
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PW-022 SAFETY BASIC:LOCKOUT-TAGOUT, LOAD AND TRANSPORT, 

FATIGUE AVOIDANCE.  DVD/00 min.  DVD covers three safety topics 
Caterpillar. (2009) 

 
PW-023 966 G/972 SAFETY & OPERATING TIPS. DVD/20 min.  
 
PW-024 SIGNALS, READ’EM OR WEEP. DVD/20 min. 
 
PW-025 824 G/825 G/826 G SERVICEABILITY AND OPERATING/CONTROLS. 

DVD/16 min.   
 
PW-026 DVEHICLE BACKING. VHS/15:39 min.  Tape discusses almost 

everything you would want to know about safe operation and care of 
dump trucks. Good tape for newly certified CDC personnel.  The Training 
Network (1995). 

 
PW-027 WINTER DRIVING (Large Trucks). VHS/10 min.  American Trucking 

Association (ATA). 
 
PW-028 HAZARD PERCEPTION: THE FOUNDATION OF DEFENSIVE DRIVING. 

VHS/ min. Discusses preparing for trips, being alert, traffic and road 
awareness tips distracted drivers and care in construction zones. 
American Trucking Association (ATA). 

 
PW-029 DETY.  VHS/14 min.   
 
 


